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Remove Drawers to access inside 
of Base Cabinets.The Left and 
Right Base Cabinets will bolt 
together with supplied connector 
bolts. 

The Left and Right Steps will bolt 
together with supplied connector 
bolts.The assembled Step will then
attach to the assembled Base by 
bolting through the Base Cabinets 
into the threaded inserts in the 
Steps. 

Remove the seat and back 
cushions. The back is attached 
with velcro, and the seat is 
attached with a cleat (push back 
slightly then lift).
The Seat Boxes will bolt together 
with supplied connector bolts and 
will bolt to the counter top into the 
threaded inserts.
 
The shared arm will bolt to the seat
boxes through the access route 
behind the back cushion as well as 
holes from inside the seat box. 
There are threaded inserts inside 
the arm.
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	QTY1: 1
	PART: 9040BX2
	FACE: D91-60 Slate Grey 
	TOP: N/A
	TOE: Molding
	ACCENT: N/A
	CUST: 
	INTERIOR: Black
	SO#: 196559
	ENG: 
	PULLS: Recessed Pulls
	Other: 
	TODAY: 01/19/2022


